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ScienceSoft delivers automated migration solutions for cross-platform 

application and database conversion. We use unique tools and know-hows 

that minimize migration risks and reduce costs for our clients to a fraction of 

alternative migration approaches. Our customers come from diverse industries 

and include Fortune 500 companies.
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SIGNIFICANT REDUCTION OF THE PROJECT COST

MINIMIZATION OF HUMAN ERRORS AND TESTING EFFORTS

EASY RE-CONVERSION

FLEXIBLE SOLUTION 

FULL-CYCLE MIGRATION

RISK FREE AND QUALITY ASSURED DELIVERABLES

 

ScienceSoft automated migration reduces the migration project 
cost by more than 70% compared to the manual conversion.

In general, manual conversion of software application is a routine 
and low productive task that leads to high probability of human 
errors. As a result a lot of efforts are required for testing. Automated 
solution substantially reduces the influence of human factor and, 
therefore, testing efforts.

During the project, you can modify requirements based on the 
intermediate results (optimize database access, change UI features 
etc), and easily re-run the conversion. 

ScienceSoft automated solution is not limited to requirements set up 
at a start point of the project. These requirements can be changed 
and accepted during the project.

 

ScienceSoft services cover all the stages of migration process. This 
means that minimal input from the Customer is required during the 
project.

We subject our software application migration solutions to 
comprehensive testing and validation procedures before delivering 
the results to the customer. We apply specific quality assurance 
methodology to ensure smooth and risk free migration process.

HIGHLY AUTOMATED SOLUTION

INDIVIDUALLY TAILORED APPROACH

~100 percent of conversion is realized automatically. This helps 
achieve handmade quality while minimizing human errors.

ScienceSoft team approaches each migration project individually. 
Individual customization of our tools ensures meeting even very 
specific code generation requirements and guidelines. 
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AUTOMATED VS. MANUAL MIGRATION

NOTE: with an increase in code lines number, the automated migration approach is becoming 
increasingly productive and cost-effective. 

 Manual Migration

Functionality, lines of code

Automated Migration
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FEATURED CUSTOMERS

SUPPORTED PLATFORMS:

Informix 4GL

Progress 4GL

PowerBuilder

Microsoft .NET
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